
   
 

 

 
Dear Eagle Scout,  
 
On Wednesday, October 18, 2023, the Western Los Angeles County Council will be hosting 
an “Eagle Scouts Recognizing Eagle Scouts” dinner.  As an Eagle Scout, you are invited 
attend this special event where we will be honoring the Eagle Scout classes of 2021, 2022, 
and 2023.  In addition, we will be honoring National Outstanding Eagle Scout award 
recipients Rick Breithaupt, Marty Kasman, Alan Rosen, and Alan Solursh.   
 
The “Eagle Scouts Recognizing Eagle Scouts” dinner will be held on Wednesday, October 
18, 2023 at the Skirball Cultural Center located at 2701 North Sepulveda Boulevard, Los 
Angeles, CA  90049.  The doors will open at approximately 6:45 p.m., and the dinner program 
will commence promptly at 7:00 p.m.  The attire for the evening is business or your Scout 
uniform. 
 
Our goal of the evening is to not only recognize the accomplishments of our fellow Eagle 
Scouts, but to introduce our new Eagle Scouts to Eagle Scout alumni.  This will be a great 
opportunity for you to meet and develop relationships with high achieving youth; offer 
college and career advice, explore internship opportunities, and share similar hobbies or 
avocations.  In addition, this will encourage Eagle Scout alumni to network and interact with 
fellow professionals. 
 
Eagle Scouts from the classes of 2021, 2022, and 2023 will be invited as our guests and will 
not be charged a fee to attend.  Dinner for our invited guests will be covered by the event 
sponsors.  During the dinner, our new Eagle Scouts will be seated with our event sponsors. 
 
You are invited to attend and/or help sponsor our “Eagle Scouts Recognizing Eagle Scouts” 
dinner.  Here is a link to our sponsorship opportunities 23Eagle.givesmart.com.  Your 
sponsorship will go toward underwriting the event, sponsoring the dinner for our new Eagle 
Scouts, and to help raise much needed funds for the Western Los Angeles County Council.  
Please register to attend the dinner no later than October 1, 2023 at 23Eagle.givesmart.com.   
 
We hope to see you at the dinner!  If you have any questions, please contact Jonathan Arnold 
at (818) 785-8700 x105 or email at Jonathan.arnold@scouting.org. 
 
Sincerely,  
 
 
 
Western Los Angeles County 
Alumni and Event Chairman 
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